OPERATIONS COMMITTEE
AGENDA
DATE: Wednesday, January 6, 2021

TIME: 6:30 p.m.

Notice: Pursuant to Governor Newsom’s Executive Orders N-29-20 and 33-20, which in
part, provide waivers to certain Brown Act provisions, meetings of the Board of Directors
will be held by teleconference. There will be no physical location from which members
of the public may participate. Instead, the public may listen and/or view the meeting
proceedings and provide public comment and comments on agenda items by following
these instructions:
To join via Zoom Webinar from a computer, tablet, or smartphone,
click on the link below:
https://zoom.us/j/91458023440
To join this meeting via telephone, please dial:
1-669-900-6833 or 1-253-215-8782
Meeting ID: 914 5802 3440
If you are unable to access the meeting using this call-in information, please contact the
Board Secretary at (619) 409-6703 for assistance.
To provide public comment on non-agenda items or to provide public comment on any
item of the agenda:
Before the meeting:
-

Go to www.sweetwater.org; click on the “HOW DO I…” at the top of the page;
and then click on the “Public Comment” link in the Contact section.

OR
-

Physically deposit your public comment in the Authority’s payment drop box
located in the public parking lot at the Authority’s Administrative Office at 505
Garrett Avenue, Chula Vista.

OR
-

Mail your comments to 505 Garrett Avenue, Chula Vista, CA 91910 [Attention:
Public Comment].

All written public comment submissions must be received 1 hour in advance of the
meeting and will be read aloud to the Board during the appropriate portion of the
meeting with a reading limit of 3 minutes for each comment.
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During the meeting:
The Chair will inquire prior to Board discussion if there are any comments from the
public on each item.
-

Via Zoom Webinar go to Participants List, hover over your name and click on “Raise
Hand.” This will notify the moderator that you wish to speak during Oral
Communication or during a specific item on the agenda.

-

Via phone, you can raise your hand by pressing *9 to notify the moderator that you
wish to speak during the current item.

Any person with a disability who requires a modification or accommodation in order to
participate in a meeting should direct such request to the Board Secretary at (619) 4096703 at least forty-eight (48) hours before the meeting, if possible. The above public
comment procedures supersede any Authority standard public comment policies and
procedures to the contrary.
1. CALL MEETING TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL
2.
3.

ITEMS TO BE ADDED, WITHDRAWN, OR REORDERED IN THE AGENDA.
PUBLIC COMMENT.
Opportunity for members of the public to address the Committee. (Government Code Section 54954.3).

4.

ACTION AGENDA.
The following items on the Action Agenda call for discussion and action by the Committee. All items are
placed on the Agenda so that the Committee may discuss and take action on the item if the Committee is
so inclined, including items listed for information.

A. Request for Remote Service - Gold Remote Service and Meter Relocation –
3342 Randy Lane A.P.N. 592-030-61
B. Consideration to Award a Contract for the Purchase of a Boom Flail Mower
Attachment
C. Consideration to Award Contracts for Vehicle Replacement Program
5.

DIRECTORS’ COMMMENTS.
Directors’ comments are comments by Directors concerning Authority business that may be of interest to
the Board. Directors’ comments are placed on the Agenda to enable individual Board members to convey
information to the Board and the Public. There is no discussion or action taken on comments made by
Board members.

6.

NEXT MEETING DATE: Wednesday, January 20, 2021 at 6:30 p.m.

7.

ADJOURNMENT.

This agenda was posted at least seventy-two (72) hours before the meeting in a location freely accessible to the Public on the exterior
bulletin board at the main entrance to the Authority’s office and it is also posted on the Authority’s website at www.sweetwater.org.
No action may be taken on any item not appearing on the posted agenda, except as provided by California Government Code Section
54954.2. Any writings or documents provided to a majority of the members of the Sweetwater Authority Governing Board regarding
any item on this agenda will be made available for public inspection at the Authority Administration Office, located at 505 Garrett
Avenue, Chula Vista, CA 91910, during normal business hours. Upon request, this agenda will be made available in appropriate
alternative formats to persons with disabilities, as required by Section 202 of the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990. Any person
with a disability who requires a modification or accommodation in order to participate in a meeting should direct such request to the
Board Secretary at (619) 409-6703 at least forty-eight (48) hours before the meeting, if possible.
To e-subscribe to receive meeting agendas and other pertinent information, please visit www.sweetwater.org.
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TO:

Governing Board (Operations Committee)

FROM:

Management

DATE:

December 31, 2020

SUBJECT:

Request for Remote Service - Gold Remote Service and Meter Relocation
– 3342 Randy Lane A.P.N. 592-030-61

SUMMARY
The existing residence at 3342 Randy Lane is currently served water from an 8-inch
gravity system main that ends at the intersection of Randy Lane and Randy Court.
Service is provided through one of several banked meters near the end of the water
main, and a private water service lateral running approximately 800 feet up Randy Lane
to the subject residence. As a result of the higher elevation, pressure is reduced to a
marginal level of 23 psi under static conditions, requiring the residence to utilize a pump
to augment service pressure. The Authority contributed to the cost of installation of the
current pump.
The 8-inch main feeding this water service connects to the existing 36-inch transmission
main on Bonita Road. During a recently required shutdown to place the new 36-inch
transmission main into service, the 8-inch main was temporarily disconnected from its
nearest connection to the transmission main, resulting in a more remote connection
further to the west. In addition, the main was used to fill the new transmission main prior
to placing it in service. While all water services on Randy Lane were kept active, the
temporary condition involving a more remote connection of the 8-inch main and the
additional demand imposed by the filling of the new transmission main resulted in a
pressure drop. The pressure drop was such that it apparently fell below the operating
range of the water pump at the subject residence. As a result, the homeowner informed
the Authority that the pump was damaged and submitted a claim.
The homeowner’s claim requesting replacement of the pump and two plumbing fixtures
has been settled through the Authority’s insurer, ACWA-JPIA. As this is the second time
the private water pump was damaged, the homeowner has requested that the Authority
provide a new water service connection from a higher pressure system near Bonita
Valley Reservoir, thereby eliminating the need for a pump. Fulfilling this request would
require the abandonment of the existing service and installing a new service in the
vicinity of Bonita Valley Reservoir within the Authority’s existing easement. At that
location, there is an existing main from the Lynwood Hills pressure system that would
raise static pressure to 79 psi. The homeowner has agreed to incur the expense of
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installing the new private lateral from the newly proposed meter location, through the
neighboring parcel to the west, and on to their residence.
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION REQUESTED BY OPERATIONS COMMITTEE
This item was considered at the December 2, 2020 Operations Committee, including a
discussion that the homeowner’s expectation is that the Authority would pay for the
water service lateral relocation along with the abandonment of the existing water service
lateral. The Operations Committee tabled consideration of the request until after
receiving an opinion from legal counsel regarding the Authority sharing in the cost of the
proposed meter relocation.
Legal counsel’s guidance is that if the Authority does agree to pay for all or a portion of
the costs of relocating the meter for 3342 Randy Lane, it would not be considered a
prohibited gift of public funds because the Authority would have a public interest in
preventing future liabilities or disputes with the homeowner regarding water pressure
and the private pump(s). In addition, legal counsel recommends that if the Authority
participates in the cost of the water service lateral relocation, that an agreement be
executed between the Authority and the homeowner under which the homeowner would
agree to be fully responsible and release the Authority from all future issues relating to
the remote service, water pressure, private easement, etc. Legal counsel would be
tasked with drafting such an agreement if the Board provides direction for the Authority
to pay for all or a portion of the cost of the water service lateral relocation.
Subject to Authority agreement to relocate the meter, installing a private service lateral
through a neighboring parcel would constitute a remote service condition. In accordance
with the Authority’s Rates and Rules, a remote service requires Board approval. The
subject parcel meets the requirements for approval of a remote service. While the
transmission main serving the Bonita Valley Reservoir fronts the subject parcel, it is not
intended for service connections and, therefore, no distribution main fronts the parcel,
satisfying that requirement for a remote service. In addition, staff has determined that a
water main extension is not required for future service to the area and would not be
practical for one additional service.
As further required by the Rates and Rules, a private utility easement to allow for
installation of the remote service through the neighboring parcel is apparently available.
Staff would confirm that this private utility easement is recorded prior to any work being
implemented, pending Board authorization for the remote service. In addition, subject to
approval of the remote service, a pressure zone boundary adjustment would be made to
incorporate the subject parcel into the Lynwood Hills pressure system.
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PAST BOARD AND COMMITTEE ACTION
December 2, 2020

The Operations Committee tabled consideration of the request
until after receiving an opinion from legal counsel regarding the
Authority sharing in the cost of the proposed meter relocation.

FISCAL IMPACT
Subject to Board authorization to relocate the meter, the Authority could incur partial to
full cost of constructing a new water service and abandoning the existing service,
depending on the alternative selected. The cost of the new service and abandonment of
the existing service is estimated to be in the $10,000 to $15,000 range. The homeowner
would pay for all costs associated with the installation of the private-side portion of the
new water service.
POLICY
It is the Authority’s policy for the Board to consider approval of a remote service to serve
an area where it is determined that a water main extension is not required.
ALTERNATIVES
1. Reject the request for meter relocation and continue to provide service from the
existing meter.
2. Approve the remote service request and relocate the water service with costs paid in
full by the homeowner.
3. Approve the remote service request and relocate the water service with costs shared
equally between the Authority and homeowner.
4. Approve the remote service request and relocate the water service with the Authority
incurring all costs.
STAFF RECOMMENDATION
Staff defers to the Governing Board for direction.
ATTACHMENT
Sketch – Remote Service Request and Meter Relocation
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TO:

Governing Board (Operations Committee)

FROM:

Management

DATE:

December 31, 2020

SUBJECT:

Consideration to Award a Contract for the Purchase of a Boom Flail
Mower Attachment

SUMMARY
The Authority recently issued a Request for Quotes (RFQ) to six vendors for the
purchase of a boom flail mower attachment. Of the six vendors identified who provide
this type of equipment, none were local, as defined by the Preferential Purchasing
Policy for Local Businesses. The RFQ indicated that an award of contract would be
provided to one service provider. In addition to direct outreach to the six vendors, and in
an effort to reach other potential vendors, an advertisement was posted on the
Authority’s website.
This equipment will help the Authority comply with the County of San Diego Defensible
Space for Fire Protection Ordinance NO.10147 (N.S.) SEC. 68.404. This Ordinance
requires that combustible vegetation be removed within ten feet of each side of
highways, private roads, and driveways. The most cost-effective method for removing
this vegetation is the use of a boom flail mower attachment.
Currently, the Authority does not have the mowing equipment to do all of the needed
vegetation maintenance of roadsides at both Sweetwater Reservoir and Loveland
Reservoir. In the past, staff has had to rent equipment with a boom flail mower
attachment to perform mowing on uneven surfaces and slopes that the Authority’s
standard flail mower cannot access.
The rental costs combined with the additional staff time make purchasing the equipment
a more cost-effective approach in the long run.
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION REQUESTED BY OPERATIONS COMMITTEE
At its December 2, 2020, meeting, the Operations Committee tabled consideration of
awarding a contract until after receiving additional information regarding 1) payback
period; 2) cost-effectiveness of alternatives to purchase of the boom flail mower such as
renting or contracting out the work; and 3) alternative equipment to perform the work
that is less costly. This section addresses those information requests.
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Payback Period
Rental costs include the mower implement and tractor. The implement is not rented
separately. Under the vehicle/equipment replacement program, a tractor replaced in
2018 was specified to be compatible with this implement. Purchase of this implement
was delayed to spread out the cost impact. Boom flail mowers are a specialized piece of
equipment and are not readily available for rental. Owning this attachment will allow
flexibility in determining staff work assignments. In previous years, the rental
tractor/boom flail mower was not available when required. This impacted staffing
schedules and time-sensitive projects. The payback of purchasing a boom flail mower is
less than 4 years.
Cost-effectiveness of Alternatives
Purchase

Annual
Annual Cost*
Maintenance
$67,133.79
$2,000.00
$6,475.59
Not applicable
$20,800.00

Purchase boom flail mower
Rental cost of tractor and boom flail
mower ($10,000 per month plus $400
drop off/pick up charge)
Contract cost, includes operator ($1,300
Not applicable
per day for 44 working days)
* It's expected that the purchased flail mower will last 15 years.

$57,200.00

Even once staff time is subtracted from Contract cost, the annual cost to contract
operator, tractor, and boom flail mower would still be about six times the cost of
purchase. All costs are present day. Rental costs and contract costs will likely increase
with time.
Pros and Cons (Purchase vs. Rental vs. Contracting Out):
Purchase boom flail
mower
Rental of tractor and
boom flail mower
Contract tractor, boom
flail mower and operator

Pros
-Lowest cost
-Always available
-Vendor maintains

-Vendor maintains

Cons
-SWA maintains
-Cost 3x purchase
-Cost increases in future
-Not always available
-Cost 6x purchase
-Cost increases in future
-Not always available
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Alternative Equipment
Staff also evaluated the equipment found on the website by a Board Member and
presented at the Operations Committee Meeting. Below is a summary of the pros/cons
of purchasing the alternative equipment presented at the meeting versus the staffrecommended boom flail mower.
Pros and Cons (alternative equipment mentioned during December 2, 2020 Operations
Committee meeting vs. staff recommended boom flail mower):
Alternative mentioned
during December 2, 2020
Operations Committee
meeting
Staff recommended boom
flail mower

Pros
-Lower cost

-Fits existing tractor
-Ease of use for tractor vs
rigid track loader
-Has reach for Loveland
roads sides.
-60-inch wide mowing
head, so 66% larger with
much higher mowing rate

Cons
-Doesn’t fit existing tractor
-Doesn’t have reach for
Loveland roads side
-36-inch wide mowing head
-Higher cost

BID INFORMATION
The RFQ solicited bids for the purchase of the following equipment:
•
•

•
•

The equipment configuration is a 2020 Boom Flail Mower to be mounted on a
2018 John Deere 5115M that the Authority already owns.
Provisional consideration that the Authority is willing to consider 2019, 2020, or
2021 model year quotes if available. If the vendor selected the 2019 or 2021
option, the vendor must provide any deviations from the specifications on the
Bidder’s Response Sheet.
Authorized Representative: Bidder must be an authorized sales, service, and
warranty representative for the manufacturer of the equipment offered.
Manuals: Each equipment shall be delivered with the following manuals: DVD/CD
format copy will be acceptable in lieu of hard copies: One (1) Set of Repair
Manuals, One (1) Set of Service Manuals, One (1) Set of Trouble Shooting
Manuals, and One (1) Set of Powertrain Control Diagnostic Manuals
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•

Warranty: The successful Bidder shall bear all material and labor costs to repair
the equipment covered under the standard manufacturer’s warranty policy. In
addition, equipment shall include a minimum five (5) year warranty against paint
fading, cracking, peeling, blistering, and rusting.

The quotes reflected on the preliminary bid tabulation (Attachment 1) reflect the
responsive bid/bidders and total procurement cost for the purchase of a boom flail
mower attachment.
Preliminary Bid Tabulation Summary (Total Purchase Price):
Powerland Equipment, Inc.

Valley Center, CA

$67,133.79

PAST BOARD AND COMMITTEE ACTION
December 2, 2020

The Operations Committee tabled consideration of awarding a
contract until after receiving additional information regarding: 1)
payback period; 2) cost-effectiveness of alternatives to purchase
of the boom flail mower such as renting or contracting out the
work; and 3) alternative equipment to perform the work that is
less costly.

June 24, 2020

The Governing Board adopted Resolution 20-13, Adopting a
Budget for the Fiscal Year 2020-21.

June 24, 2020

The Governing Board approved the FY2020-21 Strategic Plan
Detailed Work Plan

FISCAL IMPACT
Funding in the amount of $75,000 was included in the FY 2020-21 Budget for the
purchase of a boom flail mower attachment. Specific detailed information for this
purchase can be found in the FY 2020-21 Budget (Attachment 2).
POLICY
Strategic Plan Goal 5: Workforce Development and Constructive Labor Relations (WD)
- Attract, retain and develop a highly-skilled, adaptable workforce; Equip employees to
effectively and safely perform their jobs and prepare for career advancement; Promote
constructive labor relations.
•

Objective WD5: Properly equip staff to effectively, efficiently, and safely perform
their assigned duties
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o Task 005.00: Purchase a boom flail mower attachment for the ag tractor
ALTERNATIVES
1. Award a contract to the lowest responsive bidder for the boom flail mower
attachment to Powerland Equipment, Inc. Valley Center, CA in the amount of
$67,133.79.
2. Reject all bids and direct staff to rebid.
3. Other direction as determined by the Governing Board.
STAFF RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends that the Governing Board award a contract to the lowest responsive
bidder for the boom flail mower attachment to Powerland Equipment, Inc. Valley Center,
CA in the amount of $67,133.79.
ATTACHMENTS
1. Preliminary Bid Tabulation
2. FY 2020-21 Capital Investment Budget – Engineering
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Preliminary Bid Tabulation
Buyer:
Project Mgr:
RFQ No.
Bid Due:

Sylvia McCain
Mike Wallace
S2021-09 Boom Flail Mower
11/12/2020

Powerland Equipment,
Inc.
Valley Center, CA
No

Local Vendor:
Item No.

Description

Qty

Cost

1

Boom Flail Mower

1

$61,732.22

2

Manuals

1

$100.00

3

Additional Charges

$0.00

4

Sales Tax (8.75%)

$5,401.57
$67,233.79

Total Cost:
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TO:

Governing Board (Operations Committee)

FROM:

Management

DATE:

December 31, 2020

SUBJECT:

Consideration to Award Contracts for Vehicle Replacement Program

SUMMARY
The Authority recently issued a Request for Quotes (RFQ) to 21 vendors for the
purchase of vehicles. Of the 21 vendors, four were identified as local, as defined by the
Preferential Purchasing Policy for Local Businesses, and another four were located in
the city of Chula Vista but outside of the Authority’s service area. In addition to direct
outreach to the 21 vendors, and in an effort to reach other potential vendors, an
advertisement was posted to the Authority’s website and in The San Diego UnionTribune.
The FY 2020-21 Budget includes the purchase of fifteen vehicles:
• one electric passenger vehicle
• one hybrid 4 wheel drive vehicle
• six light-duty trucks
• seven lease buy-out vehicles that are at the end of their lease term.
The Authority has standardized its fleet in order to benefit from increased maintenance
efficiencies, reduced operating cost, and streamlining the specification and bid process.
In accordance, the standardized manufacturer of light-duty trucks and sport utility
vehicles is Ford Motor Company (Ford). There is no standardization at this time for
electric, hybrid, or alternative fuel vehicles.
The Authority requested alternate pricing as follows:
Option “A” – Standard Fuel
Option “B” – Dual fuel (hybrid) options for same class of vehicle
Three (3) bids were received in response to the RFQ, as shown on the attached
Preliminary Bid Tabulation. Follow-up with the local businesses who received direct
outreach from the Authority indicated the following reasons for not responding to the
RFQ: lack of fleet sales department, vehicle not in inventory, did not understand bid
process, and not the type of vehicle they sell.
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The bid submitted by Penske Chevrolet for Item #3 is non-responsive as the body
builder is not within the Authority’s mileage requirement.
The summary of the lowest responsive bidders for each item are as follows:
Bid
Item

Dealership

Description

Price

#1

Kearny Mesa
Subaru – San
Diego

One (1) 2020 All-Wheel Drive (AWD)
Four-Door, Plug-in Hybrid, Sport Utility
Vehicle

$40,650.79

#2

Penske Ford –
La Mesa

Three (3) 2020 F 250 3/4 Ton Extended
Cab, HD 4X2 Pick-Up

$90,807.24

#3

Penske Ford –
La Mesa

2020 F 350 Single Rear Wheel 1 Ton,
Extended Cab, Utility Bed, HD 4X2 Utility
Truck

$50,052.88

#4

Penske Ford –
La Mesa

2020 F 250 Single Rear Wheel 3/4 Ton,
Crew Cab, Utility Bed, HD 4X4 Utility
Truck

$52,891.25

#5

Penske Ford –
La Mesa

2020 F 250 Single Rear Wheel 3/4 Ton,
Crew Cab, Pickup Box Delete, HD 4X4
Truck

$37,881.58

#6

Penske
Chevrolet Cerritos

2020 Front Wheel Drive Electric Vehicle

$31,479.67

PAST BOARD ACTION
June 24, 2020

The Governing Board adopted Resolution 20-13, Adopting a Budget
for the Fiscal Year 2020-21.

June 24, 2020

The Governing Board approved the FY2020-21 Strategic Plan
Detailed Work Plan.

FISCAL IMPACT
The FY 2020-21 Capital Investment Budget includes funding in Vehicle Replacement to
purchase one electric passenger vehicle, one hybrid 4 wheel drive vehicle, and six lightduty trucks.
Vehicle Replacement
Less Electric Chargers and Installation – 2
Less New Potable Water Trailer

$470,000.00
<17,000.00>
<23,000.00>
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Less Lease Buy-out of FY 2015-16 Vehicles – 7
Less Lease Payments for FY 2015-16 Vehicles
Amount for 8 Vehicles
Less Contract Awards for 8 Vehicles
Remaining Balance

<42,000.00>
<22,000.00>
$366,000.00
<303,763.41>
$62,236.59

POLICY
Strategic Plan Goal 2: System and Water Supply Reliability: Achieve an uninterrupted,
long-term water supply through investment, maintenance, innovation and developing
local water resources.
•

Objective SR4: Maintain and replace fleet vehicles and equipment in accordance
with manufacturers’ recognized standards and practices, and the Authority’s
Fleet Maintenance and Replacement Program.

ALTERNATIVES
1. Declare Bid Item #3 from Penske Chevrolet as non-responsive and award a contract
to Penske Ford – La Mesa, Kearny Mesa Subaru – San Diego, and Penske
Chevrolet - Cerritos based on recommendation.
• Bid Item #1 – Kearny Mesa Subaru – San Diego
• Bid Item #2 – Penske Ford – La Mesa
• Bid Item #3 – Penske Ford – La Mesa
• Bid Item #4 – Penske Ford – La Mesa
• Bid Item #5 – Penske Ford – La Mesa
• Bid Item #6 – Penske Chevrolet - Cerritos
2. Reject all bids and provide direction to staff.
3. Other direction as determined by the Governing Board.
RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends that the Governing Board declare Bid Item #3 from Penske Chevrolet
as non-responsive, and award a contract in the amount of $40,650.79 to Kearny Mesa
Subaru, San Diego, CA for the purchase of Bid Item #1, Option “B”, award a contract in
the amount of $231,632.95 to Penske Ford – La Mesa, La Mesa, CA for the purchase of
Bid Item #2 Option “A”, Bid Item # 3 Option “A”, Bid Item #4 Option “A”, Bid Item # 5
Option “A”, and award a contract in the amount of $31,479.67 to Penske Chevrolet,
Cerritos, CA for the purchase of Bid Item #6 Option “A”.
ATTACHMENT
Preliminary Bid Tabulation
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Preliminary Bid Tabulation
RFQ S2021-07
Kearny Mesa
Subaru - San
Diego
Bid Item #1
Option A
Bid Item #1
Option B
Bid Item #2
Option A
Bid Item #2
Option B
Bid Item #3
Option A
Bid Item #3
Option B
Bid Item #4
Option A
Bid Item #4
Option B
Bid Item #5
Option A
Bid Item #5
Option B
Bid Item #6
Option A

Penske
Chevrolet Cerritos

Penske Ford La Mesa

$

26,332.16

No Bid

No Bid

$

40,650.79

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$

No Bid
No Bid

$

$

$

No Bid
No Bid

49,250.58

$

54,617.39

90,807.24
No Bid

$

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

$

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

93,920.48

50,052.88
No Bid

$

52,891.25

No Bid

No Bid

39,569.34 $

37,881.58

No Bid

No Bid

31,479.67

No Bid

The bid submitted by Penske Chevrolet for Item #3 is nonresponsive as the body builder in not within the Authority's
mileage requirement.
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