

Preliminary Bid Tabulation

Buyer: Sylvia McCain
 Proj Mgr Justin Brazil
 RFQ No. RFQ S2022-05 Water Treatment Chemicals
 Bid Due: April 28, 2022 by 2:00 P.M.

Bid Item No.	Chemical	Delivery Location	UM	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
1	Cationic Polymer 20% DADMAC	PWTP	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.900	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.850	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Ammonium Sulfate	NCW	Pounds	No Bid	\$ 0.850	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.700	No Bid
3	Chlorine (1 Ton Containers)	PWTP	Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,935.000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,800.000
4	Ferric Chloride 43% (Typical)	PWTP	Dry Tons	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 824.000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,360.000	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,199.000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5A	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5%	RDF	Gallons	No Bid	\$ 2.250	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.090	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.740	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5B	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5%	NCW	Gallons	No Bid	\$ 2.450	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.090	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.980	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.400	No Bid
6	Aqua Ammonia 19.0%	PWTP	Gallons	\$ 1.950	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.070	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Liquid Ammonium Sulfate 40%	RDF	Gallons	No Bid	\$ 1.950	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.170	\$ 2.500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.850	No Bid
8A	Sodium Hydroxide	PWTP	Dry Tons	No Bid	\$ 847.000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 966.000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,062.000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 939.000	No Bid
8B	Sodium Hydroxide	RDF	Dry Tons	No Bid	\$ 965.000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,066.000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,189.000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,587.000	No Bid
9	Ferrous Chloride	PWTP	Dry Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,034.000	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,199.000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Activated Carbon Powder	PWTP	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.140	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Aluminum Sulfate 45-55%	RDF	Pounds	No Bid	\$ 0.625	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.790	No Bid
12	Sodium Chlorite 31%	PWTP	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.914	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.707	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13A	Fluosilicic Acid (23-25%)	PWTP	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.2877	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13B	Fluosilicic Acid (23-25%)	RDF	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3614	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Sodium Fluoride (90-98%)	NCW	Pounds	No Bid	\$ 4.070	No Bid	\$ 2.730	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.760	No Bid
15A	Citric Acid (Granular)	RDF	Pounds	No Bid	\$ 2.850	No Bid	\$ 4.150	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.370	\$ 2.610	No Bid
15B	Citric Acid (Granular)	PWTP	Pounds	No Bid	\$ 2.850	No Bid	\$ 4.150	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.370	\$ 2.610	No Bid
16	Copper Sulfate (Granular)	PWTP	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.450	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.930	No Bid

This is a Preliminary Bid Tabulation. All quotes are still under review. No decisions or award has been made at this time. Bidders should visit www.sweetwater.org for updates

Lowest Bidder
Sole Bidder