

Preliminary Bid Tabulation

Buyer: Karim Galeana
 Proj Mgr Justin Brazil
 RFQ No. RFQ S2024-12 Water Treatment Chemicals
 Bid Due: May 2, 2024, by 2:00 P.M.

Bid Item No.	Chemical	Delivery Location	UM	Airgas Specialty Products, Inc.	Argo Chemical, Inc.	Brenntag Pacific, Inc.	California Water Technologies LLC.	Carbon Activated Corp.	DuBois Chemicals, Inc.	Evogua Water Technologies LLC	Hamza LLC	HASA, Inc.	Hill Brothers Chemical Company	Industrial Solution Services, Inc.	International Dioxide, Inc.	JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.	Karbonous, Inc.	Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.	Olin Corporation	Pencco, Inc.	Polydyne, Inc.	Thatcher Company of Nevada, Inc.	Univar Solutions USA, Inc.
				Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
1	Cationic Polymer 20%	PWTP	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Ammonium Sulfate	NCW	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.8970	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.7900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Chlorine (1 Ton Containers)	PWTP	Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,175.0000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,329.0000	No Bid
4	Ferric Chloride 43% (Typical)	PWTP	Dry Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,178.0000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,559.0000	No Bid	\$ 1,600.0000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5A	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5%	RDF	Gallons	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.2700	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.2200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.9300	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.3940	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.4400
5B	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5%	NCW	Gallons	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.5500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.2200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.1700	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.7840	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.9400
5C	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5%	RCS-1	Gallons	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.2500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.2200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5D	Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5%	RCS-2	Gallons	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.2500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.2200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Aqua Ammonia 19.0%	PWTP	Gallons	\$ 1.1490	\$ 1.6480	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.5900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Liquid Ammonium Sulfate 40%	RDF	Gallons	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.9950	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.6600	No Bid	\$ 3.3500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.1700
8A	Sodium Hydroxide	PWTP	Dry Tons	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 685.0000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 865.0000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 783.0000
8B	Sodium Hydroxide	RDF	Dry Tons	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 803.0000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,028.0000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,020.0000
9	Ferrous Chloride	PWTP	Dry Tons	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1,669.0000	No Bid	\$ 1,600.0000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Activated Carbon Powder	PWTP	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.6000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.5500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Aluminum Sulfate 45-55%	RDF	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.6500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Sodium Chlorite 31%	PWTP	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.2500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.9300	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.9470	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13A	Fluorosilicic Acid (23-25%)	PWTP	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3050	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3186	No Bid	\$ 0.4550	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13B	Fluorosilicic Acid (23-25%)	RDF	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3450	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.3783	No Bid	\$ 0.4550	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Sodium Fluoride (90-98%)	NCW	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.9500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.8700
15A	Citric Acid (Granular)	RDF	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.2500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15B	Citric Acid (Granular)	PWTP	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.2500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	Copper Sulfate (Granular)	PWTP	Pounds	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.5500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Equal Low Bidder
Lowest Bidder
Sole Bidder

Price subject to change with 30-day written notice.

Hypochlorite includes 2.175% Mill fee